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ABSTRACT

Before the author writes about 234 million Indonesian Muslims reform RI as an Islamic State 
following the first Islamic State in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in 1 AH (622 
AD) in Medina, the author first asks forgiveness from Allah SWT. Here the author tries to open the 
veil that covers the secret about 234 million Indonesian Muslims reform RI as an Islamic State 
following the first Islamic State in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in 1 AH (622 
AD) in Medina, based on Deoxyribonucleic acid (DNA). 

There are several verses that opens Allah's secret about 234 million Indonesian Muslims reform RI 
as an Islamic State following the first Islamic State in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad
saw in 1 AH (622 AD) in Medina, namely the following verses:

"And if you punish the deeds of them, with what Allah has revealed, and do not follow their 
desires. And be careful of them, so that they do not turn you away from part of what Allah has 
revealed to you. If they turn away, So know that Allah wills to bring misfortune upon them 
because of some of their sins. And indeed, most people are wicked people (Al Maa'idah: 5: 49)

"O you who believe, obey Allah and obey the Messenger and the ulil amri among you. Then if you
differ in opinion, then return the difference of opinion to Allah and the Messenger, if you truly 
believe in Allah and the Last Day. That is more important and the consequences are better (An 
Nisaa': 4: 59)

"And those who accept the call of their God and perform prayer, and their interests by 
deliberation between them and they spend part of the sustenance that We have given them. (Ash 
Syuura: 42: 38)

In an effort to uncover Allah's secret about 234 million Indonesian Muslims reform RI as an Islamic
State following the first Islamic State in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in 1 AH
(622 AD) in Medina, the author uses the basis of deoxyribonucleic acid.

HYPOTHESIS

Here the author proposes hypothesis 234 million Indonesian Muslims reform RI as an Islamic State 
following the first Islamic State in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in 1 AH (622 
AD) in Medina, based on Deoxyribonucleic acid (DNA)

DEOXYRIBONUCLIC ACID (DNA)

DNA is a storehouse of genetic information that has a double structure that forms a double helix and
contains polynucleotide macromolecules which are composed repeatedly of nucleotide polymers. 
This nucleotide consists of folate, a 5-carbon sugar and one of the nitrogen bases. The nitrogen 
bases are Guanine (G), Adenine (A), Cytosine (C) and Thymine (T).



Guanine (G) consists of 5 carbon atoms, 5 nitrogen atoms, 1 oxygen atom and 5 hydrogen atoms. 
Adenine(A) has 5 carbon atoms, 5 nitrogen atoms and 5 hydrogen atoms. Cytosine (C) contains 4 
carbon atoms, 3 nitrogen atoms, 1 oxygen atom and 5 hydrogen atoms. Thymine (T) contains 5 
carbon atoms. 2 nitrogen atoms, 2 oxygen atoms and 6 hydrogen atoms. Folate contains 1 
phosphorus atom, 4 oxygen atoms and 2 hydrogen atoms. 5 carbon sugar has 5 carbon atoms, 2 
oxygen atoms and 8 hydrogen atoms.

Based on human deoxyribonucleic acid (DNA), it consists of 32.20% carbon atoms, 25.43% 
nitrogen atoms, 6.78% oxygen atoms and 35.59% hydrogen atoms. Where carbon, nitrogen, oxygen
and hydrogen atoms are widely available around us and in the atmosphere.

234 MILLION INDONESIAN MUSLIMS REFORM RI AS AN ISLAMIC STATE 
FOLLOWING THE FIRST ISLAMIC STATE IN THE WORLD FOUNDED BY THE 
PROPHET MUHAMMAD SAW IN 1 AH (622 AD) IN MEDINA

So now, we are still concentrating our minds on uncovering the secret contained behind the verses: 
"...if you punish the deeds of them, with what Allah has revealed...(Al Maa'idah: 5: 49)"...their interests 
by deliberation between them...(Ash Syuura: 42: 38).

Well, here Allah declares: "...if you punish the deeds of them, with what Allah has revealed...(Al 
Maa'idah: 5: 49)"...their interests by deliberation between them...(Ash Syuura: 42: 38).

Well, Allah declared "...if you punish the deeds of them, with what Allah has revealed...(Al Maa'idah: 5:
49)"...their interests by deliberation between them...(Ash Syuura: 42: 38).

It turns out, in this declaration of Allah, there are two important factors that served as the basis for 
the first Islamic state in the world which was founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina, 
namely "...deliberation...(Ash Syuura: 42: 38) and ".. .law...(Al Maa'idah: 5: 49).

Well, these two important factors have become the basis of the first Islamic state in the world which
was founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina.

Anything that concerns the development of the first Islamic state in the world founded by the 
Prophet, Head of State Muhammad saw in Medina must be based on "...deliberation...(Ash Syuura: 
42: 38) and refer to "... law...revealed by Allah...(Al Maa'idah: 5: 49).

The Constitution which became the foundation of the first Islamic state in the world founded by the 
Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina was the result of a political agreement between the Muslims 
(the Khazraj tribe, the Aus tribe and the Muhajirin) and the Jews (the Qainuqa tribe, Bani Nadhir 
and Bani Quraizhah) in Medina.

Where the Constitution which became the foundation of the first Islamic state in the world founded 
by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina covers the formation of the ummah, human rights, 
religious unity, unity of all citizens, minority groups, duties of citizens, protecting the state, state 
leadership and politics. peace.

So, from the contents of the Constitution or Constitution of Medina which became the foundation of
the first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina, it is more 
advanced and covers all aspects of life in the country.

As a minority group, they are given the freedom to embrace their respective religions. Under the 
protection of human rights, each tribe is given the freedom to maintain its customs.



So, in fact, the first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina is 
a modern state in the world.

Well, now, the question arises,

Can the Republic of Indonesia become an Indonesian Islamic State that takes the example of the 
first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina?

The answer is, of course, it is possible, with a strong desire and encouragement from 234 million 
Indonesian Muslims, to build the Republic of Indonesia into an Indonesian Islamic State that takes 
the example of the first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in 
Medina, with a Constitution that refers to Constitution of Medina which was used as the legal basis 
of the first Islamic state in the world which refers to "...obey Allah and obey the Messenger...(An 
Nisaa': 4: 59).

So now, 234 million Indonesian Muslims, based on the Constitution of the first Islamic state in the 
world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina which includes the formation of an 
ummah, human rights, religious unity, unity of all citizens, minority groups, duties of citizens, 
protecting the state, state leadership and peace politics can build the Indonesian Islamic State.

Or in other words, the Constitution of the first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet 
Muhammad saw in Medina which includes the formation of the ummah, human rights, religious 
unity, unity of all citizens, minority groups, duties of citizens, protecting the state, leadership of the 
state and the politics of peace is better than the Constitution which is based on Pancasila, created by
secularist Soekarno.

CONCLUSION

From what has been explained above, it can be concluded that the secret contained behind the 
verses: "...if you punish the deeds of them, with what Allah has revealed...(Al Maa'idah: 5: 49)"...their 
interests by deliberation between them...(Ash Syuura: 42: 38).

Well, here Allah declares: "...if you punish the deeds of them, with what Allah has revealed...(Al 
Maa'idah: 5: 49)"...their interests by deliberation between them...(Ash Syuura: 42: 38).

Well, Allah declared "...if you punish the deeds of them, with what Allah has revealed...(Al Maa'idah: 5:
49)"...their interests by deliberation between them...(Ash Syuura: 42: 38).

It turns out, in this declaration of Allah, there are two important factors that served as the basis for 
the first Islamic state in the world which was founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina, 
namely "...deliberation...(Ash Syuura: 42: 38) and ".. .law...(Al Maa'idah: 5: 49).

Well, these two important factors have become the basis of the first Islamic state in the world which
was founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina.

Anything that concerns the development of the first Islamic state in the world founded by the 
Prophet, Head of State Muhammad saw in Medina must be based on "...deliberation...(Ash Syuura: 
42: 38) and refer to "... law...revealed by Allah...(Al Maa'idah: 5: 49).

The Constitution which became the foundation of the first Islamic state in the world founded by the 
Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina was the result of a political agreement between the Muslims 
(the Khazraj tribe, the Aus tribe and the Muhajirin) and the Jews (the Qainuqa tribe, Bani Nadhir 
and Bani Quraizhah) in Medina.



Where the Constitution which became the foundation of the first Islamic state in the world founded 
by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina covers the formation of the ummah, human rights, 
religious unity, unity of all citizens, minority groups, duties of citizens, protecting the state, state 
leadership and politics. peace.

So, from the contents of the Constitution or Constitution of Medina which became the foundation of
the first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina, it is more 
advanced and covers all aspects of life in the country.

As a minority group, they are given the freedom to embrace their respective religions. Under the 
protection of human rights, each tribe is given the freedom to maintain its customs.

So, in fact, the first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina is 
a modern state in the world.

Well, now, the question arises,

Can the Republic of Indonesia become an Indonesian Islamic State that takes the example of the 
first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina?

The answer is, of course, it is possible, with a strong desire and encouragement from 234 million 
Indonesian Muslims, to build the Republic of Indonesia into an Indonesian Islamic State that takes 
the example of the first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in 
Medina, with a Constitution that refers to Constitution of Medina which was used as the legal basis 
of the first Islamic state in the world which refers to "...obey Allah and obey the Messenger...(An 
Nisaa': 4: 59).

So now, 234 million Indonesian Muslims, based on the Constitution of the first Islamic state in the 
world founded by the Prophet Muhammad saw in Medina which includes the formation of an 
ummah, human rights, religious unity, unity of all citizens, minority groups, duties of citizens, 
protecting the state, state leadership and peace politics can build the Indonesian Islamic State.

Or in other words, the Constitution of the first Islamic state in the world founded by the Prophet 
Muhammad saw in Medina which includes the formation of the ummah, human rights, religious 
unity, unity of all citizens, minority groups, duties of citizens, protecting the state, leadership of the 
state and the politics of peace is better than the Constitution which is based on Pancasila, created by
secularist Soekarno.
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