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ABSTRACT

Before the author writes about Yahshua = spirit = atom, not God, Orthodox, Catholic, Protestant do 
not understand, first the author asks forgiveness from Allah SWT. Here the author tries to open the 
veil that covers the secret about Yahshua = spirit = atom, not God, Orthodox, Catholic, Protestant do
not understand, based on deoxyribonucleic acid (DNA).

There are several verses that reveal Allah's secret about Yahshua = spirit = atom, not God, 
Orthodox, Catholic, Protestant do not understand, namely the following verses:

"So when I have perfected the life of Adam and breathed into Adam my spirit, then you will fall 
down and prostrate to him." (Shaad: 38: 72)

"And Mary bint Imran who maintained her honour, then We breathed into Mary's womb Our 
spirit, and she confirmed the words of her Rabb and His Books, and she was one of those who 
obey. (At Tahrim: 66: 12)

"So Maryam created a veil from them, then We sent Our spirit to her, then Our spirit incarnated 
before Mary a perfect human (Maryam: 19: 17)

"Who has created the seven skys in layers. You do not see in the creation of the Most Gracious 
God anything that is not balanced. So look again and again, do you see anything that is not 
balanced? (Al Mulk: 67: 3)

In an effort to open the veil of Allah's secret about Yahshua = spirit = atom, not God, Orthodox, 
Catholic, Protestant do not understand, the author uses the basis of deoxyribonucleic acid.

HYPOTHESIS

Here the author proposes hypothesis Yahshua = spirit = atom, not God, Orthodox, Catholic, 
Protestant do not understand, based on Deoxyribonucleic acid (DNA)

PHOTON

Photons are elementary particles of the boson type and carriers of electromagnetic interactions.

QUARKS

If we want to know quarks then we pay attention to one of the hydrogen atoms which is a building 
element of the human body, animals, plants and fruit as well as inanimate objects. Then we open the
body of the hydrogen atom, we will find one electron and one proton nucleus. Next, if this proton is 
split, we will find two up quarks and one down quark. Where these three quarks are combined with 
a gluon.



DEOXYRIBONUCLIC ACID (DNA)

DNA is a storehouse of genetic information that has a double structure that forms a double helix and
contains polynucleotide macromolecules which are composed repeatedly of nucleotide polymers. 
This nucleotide consists of folate, a 5-carbon sugar and one of the nitrogen bases. The nitrogen 
bases are Guanine (G), Adenine (A), Cytosine (C) and Thymine (T).

Guanine (G) consists of 5 carbon atoms, 5 nitrogen atoms, 1 oxygen atom and 5 hydrogen atoms. 
Adenine(A) has 5 carbon atoms, 5 nitrogen atoms and 5 hydrogen atoms. Cytosine (C) contains 4 
carbon atoms, 3 nitrogen atoms, 1 oxygen atom and 5 hydrogen atoms. Thymine (T) contains 5 
carbon atoms. 2 nitrogen atoms, 2 oxygen atoms and 6 hydrogen atoms. Folate contains 1 
phosphorus atom, 4 oxygen atoms and 2 hydrogen atoms. 5 carbon sugar has 5 carbon atoms, 2 
oxygen atoms and 8 hydrogen atoms.

Based on human deoxyribonucleic acid (DNA), it consists of 32.20% carbon atoms, 25.43% 
nitrogen atoms, 6.78% oxygen atoms and 35.59% hydrogen atoms. Where carbon, nitrogen, oxygen
and hydrogen atoms are widely available around us and in the atmosphere.

YAHSHUA = SPIRIT = ATOMS, NOT GOD, ORTHODOX, CATHOLIC, PROTESTANT 
DO NOT UNDERSTAND

So now, we are still concentrating our minds on uncovering the secret contained behind the verse: 
"...Our spirit incarnated...a perfect human (Maryam: 19: 17)

Well, here Allah or God or Jahve or Jehovah has revealed the real secret about who Yahshua is or 
who Jesus Christ is or who Jesus is with the declaration of Allah or God's declaration or Jahve's 
declaration or Jehovah's declaration "...Our spirit incarnated...a perfect human (Maryam: 19: 17).

So now the question arises,

Is it true that all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world think that Yahshua was 
incarnation of God or Yahweh or Jehovah ?

Is there empirical evidence that God or Jahve or Jehovah was incarnated as Yahshua in Mary's 
womb, so that Yahshua is considered the son of Jahve or Jehovah's son?

Well, the answer is in the secret behind the verse: "...Our spirit incarnated...a perfect human 
(Maryam: 19: 17).

Well, it turns out that according to all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John,
Peter including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world are 
considered Yahshua is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same as God or the same as Jahve or the 
same as Jehovah.

Well, now the opinion of all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter 
including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world who think
that Yahshua is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same with God or the same as Jahve or the same 
as Jehovah is a big mistake. Why ?

Because, what is meant by Allah or by Jahve or by Jehovah about spirit is the building of hydrogen 
atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms which form the nervous system, which is in 



every human body, is in every animal body, is in plants, flowers , fungi, bacteria, amoeba, viruses.

Or in other words, spirit is a building of hydrogen atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen 
atoms which are the source of life in the universe.

So actually, the spirit is not God or the spirit is not Allah or the spirit is not Jahve or the spirit is not 
Jehovah.

So now, if all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world who think that Yahshua
is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same as God or the same as Jahve or the same as Jehovah, then
their assumption is a heretical assumption.

Well, because all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world who think that Yahshua
is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same as God or the same as Jahve or the same as Jehovah, then
all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the Pope in the 
Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world become heretical.

Well, the misguided path taken by all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John,
Peter including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world is 
not realized and not understood.

So until now all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world are still following the 
misguided path of following the path of Yahshua which is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same 
as God or the same as Jahve or the same as Jehovah.

In fact, if all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the Pope
in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world would open the way of 
thought, it would be found that spirit or "...our spirit ...(Maryam : 19: 17) or "...Allah's spirit...
(Maryam : 19: 17) or "...my spirit...(Shaad : 38: 72) or the spirit of God or the spirit of Jahve or 
Jehovah's spirit is a building of hydrogen atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms 
which form the nervous system in every human body, in every animal body, in plants, flowers, 
fungi, bacteria, amoeba, viruses.

So the spirit is not God, but a building of hydrogen atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen 
atoms which form the nervous system.

So actually, spirit or "...our spirit ...(Maryam : 19: 17) or "...Allah's spirit...(Maryam : 19: 17) or "...my 
spirit...(Shaad : 38: 72) or the spirit of God or the spirit of Jahve or the spirit of Jehovah refers to the 
building of hydrogen atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms which form the nervous 
system.

Well, because all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world thousands of years ago 
did not understand what is called a quark, what is called with atoms, what is called energy, what is 
called particles, then all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter 
including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world consider 
spirit is the same as God, God is spirit, God can be incarnated into another God in human form or in
the form of Yahshua or in the form of Jesus Christ or in the form of Jesus.



So in fact, in order to all Orthodox, Catholic, Protestant, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter 
including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world do not 
continue to follow the heretical path, then their minds must be changed, from the thoughts who 
consider spirit to be the same as God, God is spirit, God can be incarnated into another God in 
human form or in the form of Yahshua, change to spirit is not God, spirit is a building of hydrogen 
atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms which form the nervous system present in 
every human body, present in every animal body, present in plants, flowers, fungi, bacteria, amoeba,
viruses.

Well, if all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the Pope 
in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world had understood that spirit is 
not God, spirit is a building of hydrogen atoms, atoms carbon, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms which 
form the nervous system are present in every human body, present in every animal body, present in 
plants, flowers, fungi, bacteria, amoeba, viruses, so all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, 
Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all 
churches in the world will be safe from going astray.

CONCLUSION
 
Based on the description above we can conclude that the secret contained behind the verse: "...Our 
spirit incarnated...a perfect human (Maryam: 19: 17)

Well, here Allah or God or Jahve or Jehovah has revealed the real secret about who Yahshua is or 
who Jesus Christ is or who Jesus is with the declaration of Allah or God's declaration or Jahve's 
declaration or Jehovah's declaration "...Our spirit incarnated...a perfect human (Maryam: 19: 17).

So now the question arises,

Is it true that all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world think that Yahshua was 
incarnation of God or Yahweh or Jehovah ?

Is there empirical evidence that God or Jahve or Jehovah was incarnated as Yahshua in Mary's 
womb, so that Yahshua is considered the son of Jahve or Jehovah's son?

Well, the answer is in the secret behind the verse: "...Our spirit incarnated...a perfect human 
(Maryam: 19: 17).

Well, it turns out that according to all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John,
Peter including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world are 
considered Yahshua is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same as God or the same as Jahve or the 
same as Jehovah.

Well, now the opinion of all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter 
including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world who think
that Yahshua is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same with God or the same as Jahve or the same 
as Jehovah is a big mistake. Why ?

Because, what is meant by Allah or by Jahve or by Jehovah about spirit is the building of hydrogen 
atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms which form the nervous system, which is in 
every human body, is in every animal body, is in plants, flowers , fungi, bacteria, amoeba, viruses.



Or in other words, spirit is a building of hydrogen atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen 
atoms which are the source of life in the universe.

So actually, the spirit is not God or the spirit is not Allah or the spirit is not Jahve or the spirit is not 
Jehovah.

So now, if all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world who think that Yahshua
is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same as God or the same as Jahve or the same as Jehovah, then
their assumption is a heretical assumption.

Well, because all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world who think that Yahshua
is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same as God or the same as Jahve or the same as Jehovah, then
all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the Pope in the 
Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world become heretical.

Well, the misguided path taken by all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John,
Peter including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world is 
not realized and not understood.

So until now all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world are still following the 
misguided path of following the path of Yahshua which is the same as spirit, and spirit is the same 
as God or the same as Jahve or the same as Jehovah.

In fact, if all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the Pope
in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world would open the way of 
thought, it would be found that spirit or "...our spirit ...(Maryam : 19: 17) or "...Allah's spirit...
(Maryam : 19: 17) or "...my spirit...(Shaad : 38: 72) or the spirit of God or the spirit of Jahve or 
Jehovah's spirit is a building of hydrogen atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms 
which form the nervous system in every human body, in every animal body, in plants, flowers, 
fungi, bacteria, amoeba, viruses.

So the spirit is not God, but a building of hydrogen atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen 
atoms which form the nervous system.

So actually, spirit or "...our spirit ...(Maryam : 19: 17) or "...Allah's spirit...(Maryam : 19: 17) or "...my 
spirit...(Shaad : 38: 72) or the spirit of God or the spirit of Jahve or the spirit of Jehovah refers to the 
building of hydrogen atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms which form the nervous 
system.

Well, because all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the 
Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world thousands of years ago 
did not understand what is called a quark, what is called with atoms, what is called energy, what is 
called particles, then all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter 
including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world consider 
spirit is the same as God, God is spirit, God can be incarnated into another God in human form or in
the form of Yahshua or in the form of Jesus Christ or in the form of Jesus.

So in fact, in order to all Orthodox, Catholic, Protestant, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter 
including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world do not 



continue to follow the heretical path, then their minds must be changed, from the thoughts who 
consider spirit to be the same as God, God is spirit, God can be incarnated into another God in 
human form or in the form of Yahshua, change to spirit is not God, spirit is a building of hydrogen 
atoms, carbon atoms, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms which form the nervous system present in 
every human body, present in every animal body, present in plants, flowers, fungi, bacteria, amoeba,
viruses.

Well, if all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the Pope 
in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all churches in the world had understood that spirit is 
not God, spirit is a building of hydrogen atoms, atoms carbon, nitrogen atoms, oxygen atoms which 
form the nervous system are present in every human body, present in every animal body, present in 
plants, flowers, fungi, bacteria, amoeba, viruses, so all Orthodox, Catholics, Protestants, Matthew, 
Mark, Luke, John, Peter including the Pope in the Vatican, Bishops, Cardinals, Pastors in all 
churches in the world will be safe from going astray.
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